
u'sut l: KSE.ID (4)- Mise. bhes Sohume 
Post Doetosed nd-uby 

MGmail 
Fwd: INWARD REMITTANCE RECEIVEDI/THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWANI/USD 

6677 

From: Burdwan Forex 
<Burdwan.Forex@axisbank.com> 

Finance Officer, BU <fo@buruniv.ac.in> 

To, Anindya Bose 
<abose@phys.buruniv.ac.in>, Accounts Officer Susobhan Ghosh <ao1@buruni.ac. in>, Audit and 

ACCOunts Officer <aao@buruniv.ac.in>, "Cash Section Finance, BU" 
<finance.cash@buruniv.ac.in>, "Sujan Das, Accounts 

Officer" <ao2 @buruniv.ac.in>, Trust Officer The University of Burdwan <to@buruniv.ac.in>, "Research Section Finance 

Department, BU" 
<finance.research@buruniv.ac.in>, HOD Biotechnology 

<hod@biotech.buruniv.ac.in> 

Forwarded message 

Date: Mon, Nov 21, 2022, 18:07 

Dear Sir, 

Subject: INWARD REMITTANCE RECEIVEDI/THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWANIJUSD 6677 

To: The Registrar, The University of Burdwan <registrar@buruniv.ac.in>, Finance Officer, BU <fo@buruniv.ac.in> 

Cc: Subhro Sen <Subhro. Sen@axisbank.com>, Santu Mahadeb Banerjee 
<Santu.Banerjee@axisbank.com> 

Disposal instruction form is attached for reference. 

:20:Sender"s Reference 

3259955139 

Please be informed that we have received the below inward remittance of USD 6677, yOU are request 

tó provide the disposal instruction to process further. 

CRED 

r. Anindyo Boe-lesk. I physien 

:23B:Bank Operation Code 

:32A: Val Date/Curr/Interbnk Settld Amt 

Date : 09-11-2022 

Currency : USD 
Amount: 6700 

:50K: Ordering Customer-Name & Address 
Ordering Customer-Name /013070743 

Ordering 
Customer-Address:TERTIARY EDUCATION TRUST FUND 

6 ZAMBÈZI CRESCENT MAITAMA ABUJA 

:52A: Ordering Institution - BIC 
CITIGB2LXXX CITIBANK N.A, LONDON UNITED KINGDOM 

:53A: Sender's Correspondent 

:59: Beneficiary Customer - Name & Addr 

Beneficiary Custtomer- Addr :/14801010008143 

CITIUS33XXX CITIBANK N.A. NEW YORK,NY UNITED STATES OF AMERICA 

Beneficiary Customer- Name :UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN 

BENGAL INDIA 
:70: Remittance Information 

TUITION IRO ADEWUMI ADEBAYO SEGUN 

:71A: Details of Charges 

oUR 

Axs BaK 
Anindya Bqse <abose@phys.buruniv.ac.in> 

:77B: Regulatory Reporting 
/BENEFRES/IN 

Best regards, 

Mon, Nov 21. 2022 at 6:24 PM 

Wholesale Banking Service - Burdwan Branch 

Axis Bank Limited ,23 GT ROAD, BURDWAN,713101. WEST BENGAL 
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fHE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN 
Department of Physics 
Dr Anindya BOSE 
Senior Scientific Officer 
Senior Member, URSI; Fllow, IETE; Member, ASI; 1GNSS 
Chairnan, IETE Burdwan Sub Centre 
Principal Investigator, ITR-DRDO sponsored Project 
Convenor, Industry-Institute Partnership Cell (I1PC) 

No: AB/ 2021/ 32 
To, 
Dr. Adewumi Adebayo Segun, 
Department of Pure and Applied Physics, 
Ladoke Akintola University of Technology, 
P.M.B 4000, Ogbomoso, Oyo State, Nigeria. 

Dear Sir, 
With reference to my letter No. AB/2021/6. 1, Dr Anindya Bose, Senior Scientific Officer, Dcpartment of 

Physics, The University of Burdwan, Golapbag, Burdwan 713 104, INDIA do hereby give my consent to 

host you in our Laboratory for a period of six months from March 1, 2022 to August 31, 2022 for availing 

the TETFUND Postdoctoral Fcllowship Intervention Scheme of the Government of Nigeria. I attach below 

the Bench Fees for the purpose as per the TETFUND Scheme: 

S 

No 

J.JA 
1.0 Small Scale Rescarch Expenses 

1.IB 

J.1C 

1.2 

1,3 
1.4 
Total 

Description of Items (Nos) 
BUDGET (including Bench Fees) 

NTL Geo Multi-GNSS - 01 Multifrequency GNSS 

receiver 
LI/L2, Galileo GPS LI/L2/L5, GLONASS 

EI/ESa/ESb, BeiDou BI/B2, NaviC LS/S-band and 

SBAS LI signals. On-board Computer-on-Module 
Platform with Windows/Android/Linux operation 

system., Wireless interfaces through mini-PCI Express 
connection availability. 

receiver-ntl-geo/ 

GNSS Surveying Antenna HX-CSX608A - 01 No: 

L and S Band, Survey grade 
https://ptlab,It/product/gnss-surveying-antenna-hx 
esx608a/ 

1 to 5 GNSS active signal splitter- 1 No 
L and Band, Active RF signal splitter, 

hups://ntlabJt/product/rf-splitter-splJ5/ 
Cables, connectors, Compact 
(Lattepanda/ Raspbery Pi) - assorted 
Travel costs (for fieldwork) 
Stationary, consumables 

Data processor 

Expected from TETFUND 

In INR In USD 

4,50,000 
(Including 
freight, 
import 
duty, 
taxes) 

S0,000 

Date: November 4, 2021 

S0.000 

12,000 

5,900 

700 

700 

150 
USD 7,450 

Contd to page 2 

Physiçs Department, Burdwan Unjversity, Golapbag, Burdwan 713 104, INDIA 

Cell: +91 94 34 00 44 78, FAX: +91 342 2530 452 

Email; abOse@pl1ys.buruniv.ac.in; anibose@gmail.com; Twitter : @dranibose 
Web: http://bugnss.in 

https://ntlab.It/product/nulti-constellation-igs 



AHE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN 
Department of Physics 
Dr Anindya BOSE 
Senior Scientific Officer 
Senior Member, URSI; Fellow, ETE; Member, ASI: 1GNSS 
Chainan, lETE Burdwan Sub Centre 
Principal Investigator, ITR-DRDO sponsored Project 
Convenor, Industry-Institute Partnership Cell (IPC) 

2. Cost towards time of the supervisor (1 hour per month x6 months) 

2.1 Supervisor Time Cost 

3. Institution indirect cost 

3.1 

4. Living expenses for the Fellow 
Accommodation Cost 

4.1 

Page #2 of 2 

Institution overhead (total for 6 months) 

I hope, through this effort, we will be mutually benefitted. 

With best regards. 

1250 per 
hour x 6 

months 

Total 

37.500 
Total 

6.000 per 
month 

Total 
Grand Total 

USD 
per hour x 6 
months 

16.67 

USD 100 for 
6 months 
USD 100 

S00 
USD 500 

USD 75/ 
month x 6 
months 
= USD 450 

During your tenure of work, all facilities of the GNSS Laboratory, Department of Physics, The University 

of Burdwan (GLB), Thttp://bugnss. in would be provided to you for your research work. You need to 

follow all formalities, rules and regulations of The University of Burdwan, your funding agency and 

Government of India. 

USD 450 
USD 8,500 

Sincerely Yours, 

(Anindya Bose) 
Senior Scientific Officer 

Digitally signed by ANINDYA BOSE 
Date: 2021.11.05 01:03:13 +05'30' 

Physics Department, Burdwan University, Golapbag, Burdwan 713 104, INDIA 

Cell: +91 94 34 00 44 78, FAX: +9l 342 2530 452 

Email: abose@phys.buruniv.ac.in; anibose @gmail.com; Twitter : (@dranibose 
Web: http:/bugnss. in 
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